TRAINING ROOM RENOVATION PROPOSAL FORM

(Attachment D)
LYNESS CONSTRUCTION LP
Proposer:
PLUMBING: $113,643.00
HVAC: $53,339.00
DRYWALL AND FRAMING: $55,103.00
ACQUSTICAL CEILING AND GRID: $22,618.00
TILE WORK (ceramic tile@ restrooms) $45,374.00
ELECTRICAL: NO BID
MILLWORK (@restrooms): $15,279.00
COUNTERTQPS (at restrooms only): $12,093.00
PAINTING: $56,752.00
FLOORING (carpet and base): $27,454.00
TOILET PARTITIONS (includes toilet accessories): $27,681.00
CONCRETE ¢ DEMO: NO BID
DATA CABLE AND DROPS: NO BID
FIRE ALARM DEVICES: NO BID
AUDIO VISUSAL: NO BID

Base Proposal: $_429,336.00
for all items listed above, no individual items to be separated out, we get all or none above

WE ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDA #1 DATED OCTOBER 21, 2016
SEE ATTACHED LIST OF SPEC SECTIONS THAT ARE NOT PART OF OUR BID

Alternate -1 (Folding Partition Walh 5 NOBID, DELETED PER ADDENDA #1

Aliarnate - 2 (Millwork in Training =oomy) 343,000.00 includes millwork, ceramic, sink and plbg fixture

Altzrnate - 3 (smaller Training Room Upgrade) $67,000.00 includes demo, ceiling, flooring, electrical, painting

w©

A Total Proposal: $ 539,336.00

AT OWNERS OPTION, IF YOU AWARDED ALL ITEMS IN OUR BASE BID ALONG WITH
ALTERNATE #2 AND ALTERNATE #3, DEDUCT A TOTAL OF: $36, 000.00

MAKING A NEW TOTAL FOR : $503,336,00




